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EXHIBIT A UCC-1 

All buildings, materials, machinery, apparatus, equipment, fittings, furniture, furnishings, 
fixtures and articles of personal property of every kind and nature whatsoever now or 
hereafter located on the Real Property referred to in Exhibit B or in any buildings or 
improvements on said Real Property, or any part thereof, and used or usable in connection 
with any present or future occupancy of said building and now owned or hereafter acquired 
by Debtor including, without limiting the generality of the foregoing, all heating, lighting, 
laundry, incinerating and power equipment, engines, pipes, pumps, tanks, motors, conduits, 
switchboards, plumbing, lifting, cleaning, fire prevention, fire extinguishing, refrigerating, 
ventilating and communications apparatus, air cooling and air conditioning apparatus, 
elevators, escalators, shades, awnings, screens, attached cabinets, partitions, ducts and 
compressors and any and all renewals of, replacements, accessions or additions to, 
substitutions for and proceeds of any and all of the foregoing.  

All right, title and interest in and to all leases now or hereafter existing for the Real Property 
including, without limitation, all of the rentals and other payments which are now or 
hereafter due and any renewals or extensions thereof or leases in substitution therefore. 

All rights, title and interests of Debtor in and to all other contracts in connection with the 
development and/or improvement of the Real Property including, but not limited to, 
architect’s contracts, purchase and sales agreements. 

All rights, title and interest in and to all schematic design development documents, 
drawings, plans, specifications, renderings and models and all amendments thereto, 
revisions thereof and substitutions thereof whether heretofore or hereafter made in 
connection with the development of and construction of improvements on said Real 
Property and all of Debtor’s right, title and interest in all contracts, now or hereafter entered 
into by Debtor or Debtor’s agent for sale of Real Property or any condominium; all rights of 
Debtor in connection with reach and every condominium contained in Real Property 
including, without limitation, all rights now or hereafter created or reserved to Debtor under 
any Declaration of Condominium covering all or any portion of the Real Property and all 
Special Declarant Rights created or reserved under Chapter 36.1 of Title 34 of the General 
Laws of Rhode Island. 

All right, title and interest in all engineering and environmental studies now or hereafter 
acquired with respect to the Real Property and all approvals, licenses and permits now or 
hereafter issued relating to the permitted uses of the Real Property. 

All cash or non-cash proceeds of all of the foregoing; insurance policies and proceeds 
relating thereto whether now existing or hereafter created or acquired. 



 


